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WASHINGTON, D.C. – The Alliance for Longevity Initiatives (A4LI) is excited to announce
its 2nd Annual D.C. Summit, taking place April 28–30, 2025, in Washington, D.C. This event
will once again convene policymakers, scientists, industry leaders, and advocates to drive
legislative and policy advancements in the field of longevity science.

Building on the success of last year’s inaugural Fly-In, the 2025 gathering will be a hub for
fostering collaboration between those shaping the future of longevity biotechnology and the
policymakers who can help make that future a reality. A4LI remains committed to ensuring that
advancements in aging research lead to real-world impact through actionable policy and
equitable access to innovative therapies.

“We are thrilled to build on the momentum of last year’s event.” said Dylan Livingston,
Founder and President of A4LI. “With the new Administration signaling support for
longevity-focused policies and initiatives, we’re optimistic about major legislative breakthroughs
in 2025 and 2026. This year, our goal is to lay the groundwork for those breakthroughs, using
our D.C. Summit as the cornerstone. Our industry’s advocacy work can pave the way for
transformative policies that prioritize more impactful, wide-reaching therapeutic development
targeting aging, extend healthy lifespans, and ensure equitable access to life-enhancing therapies
for all.”

The Summit empowers attendees to engage with policymakers and shape a future where
breakthroughs in longevity biotechnology translate into tangible benefits for all. For more details
and information on how to register, please visit: https://a4li.org/dc-fly-in-2025.
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For additional information, reach out to us at info@a4li.org.

About the Alliance for Longevity Initiatives (A4LI)

The Alliance for Longevity Initiatives (A4LI) is an independent 501(c)(4) nonprofit organization
committed to advancing legislation and policies that promote healthy human lifespan. With a
focus on equitable access to next-generation therapies, A4LI brings together scientists,
policymakers, and influencers to drive collaboration and innovation in the longevity biotech
industry.
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